

BM2021 Milk/Juice

Valid August 01, 2020 - July 31, 2021

Updated: 08/04/2020

Borden Dairy

Item #	Title	Description	DOE PPU	VOE PPU	MFR #	Vendor Description
20	LF White Gal	Milk; low fat (1%); unflavored; Grade A; pasteurized; homogenized; 1 gallon	1 - 4: 3.9500 5 - 6: 4.4000	1 - 4: 3.9500 5 - 6: 4.4000	25079	Borden 4/case
21	RF White Gal	Milk; Reduced Fat (2%); unflavored; Grade A; pasteurized; homogenized; 1 gallon	1 - 4: 3.95 5 - 6: 4.40	1 - 4: 3.95 5 - 6: 4.40	25078	Borden 4/case
22	Buttermilk	Milk; Buttermilk; Grade A; pasteurized; homogenized; 1/2 gallon	1: 2.25 2: 2.25 3: 2.15 4: 2.25 5: 2.30 6: 2.30	1: 2.25 2: 2.25 3: 2.15 4: 2.25 5: 2.30 6: 2.30	12154	Borden 9/case
23	LF White	Milk; Low Fat (1%); Unflavored; Grade A; pasteurized; homogenized; 1/2 pint carton	1: 0.2233 2: 0.2295 3: 0.2287 4: 0.2610 5: 0.2885 6: 0.2885	1: 0.2308 2: 0.2370 3: 0.2362 4: 0.2685 5: 0.2885 6: 0.2885	25351	Borden 50/case
24	FF White	Milk; Fat Free (skim); Unflavored; Grade A; pasteurized; homogenized; 1/2 pint carton	1: 0.2233 2: 0.2295 3: 0.2287 4: 0.2610 5: 0.2885 6: 0.2885	1: 0.2308 2: 0.2370 3: 0.2362 4: 0.2685 5: 0.2885 6: 0.2885	25352	Borden 50/case
25	LF White Pl	Milk; Low Fat (1%); Unflavored; Grade A; pasteurized; homogenized; 8 oz bottle	1: 0.2642 2: 0.2695 3: 0.2700 4: 0.2965 5: 0.3295 6: 0.3295	1: 0.2717 2: 0.2770 3: 0.2775 4: 0.3040 5: 0.3295 6: 0.3295	25399	Borden 50/case
26	FF Choc	Milk; Fat Free (skim); Chocolate; Grade A; pasteurized; homogenized; 1/2 pint carton	1: 0.2233 2: 0.2275 3: 0.2287 4: 0.2610 5: 0.2885 6: 0.2885	1: 0.2308 2: 0.2350 3: 0.2362 4: 0.2685 5: 0.2885 6: 0.2885	25604	Borden 50/case
27	FF Choc Pl	Milk; Fat Free (skim); Chocolate; Grade A; pasteurized; homogenized; 8 oz. plastic bottle	1: 0.2642 2: 0.2695 3: 0.2700 4: 0.2965 5: 0.3295 6: 0.3295	1: 0.2717 2: 0.2770 3: 0.2775 4: 0.3040 5: 0.3295 6: 0.3295	25607	Borden 50/case
28	FF St	Milk; Fat Free (skim); Strawberry; Grade A; pasteurized; homogenized; 1/2 pint carton	1: 0.2233 2: 0.2295 3: 0.2287 4: 0.2610 5: 0.2885 6: 0.2885	1: 0.2308 2: 0.2370 3: 0.2362 4: 0.2685 5: 0.2885 6: 0.2885	25603	Borden 50/case
29	FF St Pl	Milk; Fat Free (skim); Strawberry; Grade A; pasteurized; homogenized; 8 oz. plastic bottle	1: 0.2642 2: 0.2695 3: 0.2700 4: 0.2965 5: 0.3295 6: 0.3295	1: 0.2717 2: 0.2770 3: 0.2775 4: 0.3040 5: 0.3295 6: 0.3295	25609	Borden 50/case
30	LF Vanilla	Milk; Low Fat; Vanilla; Grade A; pasteurized; homogenized; 1/2 pint carton	NO BID	NO BID		
31	LF Choc	Milk; Low Fat; Chocolate; Grade A; pasteurized; homogenized; 1/2 pint carton	1: 0.2233 2: 0.2295 3: 0.2287 4: 0.2610 5: 0.2885 6: 0.2885	1: 0.2308 2: 0.2370 3: 0.2362 4: 0.2685 5: 0.2885 6: 0.2885	25396	Borden 50/case
32	LF St	Milk; Low Fat; Strawberry; Grade A; pasteurized; homogenized; 1/2 pint carton	NO BID	NO BID		
33	Lactose Free	Milk; Lactose free; 1%; 8 oz. plastic bottle	1: 0.7200 2: 0.7200 3: 0.6800 4: 0.7200 5: 0.6800 6: 0.6800	1: 0.7275 2: 0.7275 3: 0.6875 4: 0.7275 5: 0.6800 6: 0.6800	16570	Lactaid 20/case
40	Juice Apple	100% Juice; Apple; fortified with Vitamin C; 4 oz carton	1: 0.1435 2: 0.1435 3: 0.1495 4: 0.1525 5: 0.1550 6: 0.1550	1: 0.1473 2: 0.1473 3: 0.1533 4: 0.1563 5: 0.1550 6: 0.1550	25402	Borden 75/case

BM2021 Milk/Juice

Valid August 01, 2020 - July 31, 2021

Updated: 08/04/2020

Borden Dairy

Item #	Title	Description	DOE PPU	VOE PPU	MFR #	Vendor Description
41	Juice Grape	100% Juice; Grape; fortified with Vitamin C; 4 oz carton	NO BID	NO BID		
42	Juice Mixed Fruit	100% Juice; Mixed Fruit; fortified with Vitamin C; 4 oz carton	NO BID	NO BID		
43	Juice Orange	100% Juice; Orange; fortified with Vitamin C; 4 oz carton	1: 0.1445 2: 0.1445 3: 0.1525 4: 0.1525 5: 0.1695 6: 0.1695	1: 0.1483 2: 0.1483 3: 0.1563 4: 0.1563 5: 0.1695 6: 0.1695	25388	Borden 75/case
44	Juice Apple Cherry	100% Juice; Apple Cherry; fortified with Vitamin C; 4 oz carton	1: 0.1475 2: 0.1445 3: 0.1525 4: 0.1525 5: 0.1695 6: 0.1695	1: 0.1513 2: 0.1483 3: 0.1563 4: 0.1563 5: 0.1695 6: 0.1695	31997	Ardmore Farms 75/case

BM2021 Milk/Juice

Valid August 01, 2020 - July 31, 2021

Updated: 08/04/2020

Borden Dairy

Item #	Title	Description	DOE PPU	VOE PPU	MFR #	Vendor Description
--------	-------	-------------	---------	---------	-------	--------------------

Removed

- 34 Dairy Free
- 45 Juice OP

Compliance with Terms & Conditions: Yes
Current Award Status: BM1920
Purchase Orders Accepted: Yes
Payment Terms: 30

DOE: District Owned Equipment
VOE: Vendor Owned Equipment

CONTACT:

MICHAEL ARSENAULT
brenda.pride@bordendairy.com
5327 S LAMAR STREET
DALLAS, TX 75215
972-619-1528
800-432-4794 (toll-free)
214-426-5841 (fax)

Group 1

Tyler ISD

Group 2

Longview ISD, Whitehouse ISD

Group 3

Elysian Fields ISD, Grand Saline ISD, Hallsville ISD, Jacksonville ISD, Karnack ISD, Kilgore ISD, Malakoff ISD, New Diana ISD, Trinidad ISD, Union Grove ISD, Van ISD, Waskom ISD, West Rusk ISD

Group 4

Sabine ISD

Group 6

Chireno ISD, Cushing ISD, Garrison ISD

BM2021 Milk/Juice

Valid August 01, 2020 - July 31, 2021

Updated: 08/04/2020

Hiland Dairy

Item #	Title	Description	DOE PPU	VOE PPU	MFR #	Vendor Description
20	LF White Gal	Milk; low fat (1%); unflavored; Grade A; pasteurized; homogenized; 1 gallon	3.70000	3.70000	1346	Hiland/4 case
21	RF White Gal	Milk; Reduced Fat (2%); unflavored; Grade A; pasteurized; homogenized; 1 gallon	3.70000	3.70000	1201	Hiland/4 case
22	Buttermilk	Milk; Buttermilk; Grade A; pasteurized; homogenized; 1/2 gallon	2.35000	2.35000	1462	Hiland/9 case
23	LF White	Milk; Low Fat (1%); Unflavored; Grade A; pasteurized; homogenized; 1/2 pint carton	1: 0.2350 2: 0.2125 3: 0.2500	1: 0.2400 2: 0.2175 3: 0.2550	9171	Hiland/50 case
24	FF White	Milk; Fat Free (skim); Unflavored; Grade A; pasteurized; homogenized; 1/2 pint carton	1: 0.2300 2: 0.2075 3: 0.2500	1: 0.2350 2: 0.2125 3: 0.2550	9173	Hiland/50 case
25	LF White Pl	Milk; Low Fat (1%); Unflavored; Grade A; pasteurized; homogenized; 8 oz bottle	NO BID	NO BID		
26	FF Choc	Milk; Fat Free (skim); Chocolate; Grade A; pasteurized; homogenized; 1/2 pint carton	1: 0.2350 2: 0.2125 3: 0.2500	1: 0.2400 2: 0.2175 3: 0.2550	9178	Hiland/50 case
27	FF Choc Pl	Milk; Fat Free (skim); Chocolate; Grade A; pasteurized; homogenized; 8 oz. plastic bottle	NO BID	NO BID		
28	FF St	Milk; Fat Free (skim); Strawberry; Grade A; pasteurized; homogenized; 1/2 pint carton	NO BID	NO BID		
29	FF St Pl	Milk; Fat Free (skim); Strawberry; Grade A; pasteurized; homogenized; 8 oz. plastic bottle	NO BID	NO BID		
30	LF Vanilla	Milk; Low Fat; Vanilla; Grade A; pasteurized; homogenized; 1/2 pint carton	1: 0.2350 2: 0.2125 3: 0.2500	1: 0.2400 2: 0.2175 3: 0.2550	30353	Hiland/50 case
31	LF Choc	Milk; Low Fat; Chocolate; Grade A; pasteurized; homogenized; 1/2 pint carton	1: 0.2350 2: 0.2125 3: 0.2500	1: 0.2400 2: 0.2175 3: 0.2550	9175	Hiland/50 case
32	LF St	Milk; Low Fat; Strawberry; Grade A; pasteurized; homogenized; 1/2 pint carton	1: 0.2350 2: 0.2125 3: 0.2500	1: 0.2400 2: 0.2175 3: 0.2550	30352	Hiland/50 case
33	Lactose Free	Milk; Lactose free; 1%; 8 oz. plastic bottle	0.65000	0.65000		Hiland/20 case
40	Juice Apple	100% Juice; Apple; fortified with Vitamin C; 4 oz carton	1: 0.1450 2: 0.1450 3: 0.1550	1: 0.1450 2: 0.1450 3: 0.1550	9504	Hiland/75 case

BM2021 Milk/Juice

Valid August 01, 2020 - July 31, 2021

Updated: 08/04/2020

Hiland Dairy

Item #	Title	Description	DOE PPU	VOE PPU	MFR #	Vendor Description
41	Juice Grape	100% Juice; Grape; fortified with Vitamin C; 4 oz carton	NO BID	NO BID		
42	Juice Mixed Fruit	100% Juice; Mixed Fruit; fortified with Vitamin C; 4 oz carton	NO BID	NO BID		
43	Juice Orange	100% Juice; Orange; fortified with Vitamin C; 4 oz carton	1: 0.1550 2: 0.1550 3: 0.1650	1: 0.1550 2: 0.1550 3: 0.1650	9508	Hiland/75 case
44	Juice Apple Cherry	100% Juice; Apple Cherry; fortified with Vitamin C; 4 oz carton	1: 0.1550 2: 0.1550 3: 0.1650	1: 0.1550 2: 0.1550 3: 0.1650	9504	Hiland/75 case

BM2021 Milk/Juice

Valid August 01, 2020 - July 31, 2021

Updated: 08/04/2020

Hiland Dairy

Item #	Title	Description	DOE PPU	VOE PPU	MFR #	Vendor Description
--------	-------	-------------	---------	---------	-------	--------------------

Removed

34 Dairy Free
45 Juice OP

Compliance with Terms & Conditions: Yes

Current Award Status: BM1920

Purchase Orders Accepted: Yes

Payment Terms: 10

CONTACT:

GABE ANDES
gandes@hilanddairy.com
200 N FULLER
TYLER, TX 75700
214-766-4072

903-597-4431 (fax)

DOE: District Owned Equipment

VOE: Vendor Owned Equipment

Group 1

Spring Hill ISD, Neches ISD, Rains ISD

Group 2

Eustace ISD, Lindale ISD

Group 3

Quitman ISD

BM2021 Milk/Juice

Valid August 01, 2020 - July 31, 2021

Updated: 08/04/2020

Oak Farms Dean Foods Dairy

Item #	Title	Description	DOE PPU	VOE PPU	MFR #	Vendor Description
20	LF White Gal	Milk; low fat (1%); unflavored; Grade A; pasteurized; homogenized; 1 gallon	3.20000	3.20000	52098	Dairy Pure/4 case
21	RF White Gal	Milk; Reduced Fat (2%); unflavored; Grade A; pasteurized; homogenized; 1 gallon	3.25000	3.25000	51787	Dairy Pure/4 case
22	Buttermilk	Milk; Buttermilk; Grade A; pasteurized; homogenized; 1/2 gallon	1.95000	1.95000	21249	Dairy Pure/9 case
23	LF White	Milk; Low Fat (1%); Unflavored; Grade A; pasteurized; homogenized; 1/2 pint carton	1: 0.2440 2: 0.2518 3: 0.2522 4: 0.2659	1: 0.2490 2: 0.2539 3: 0.2598 4: 0.2709	52129	Dairy Pure/50 case
24	FF White	Milk; Fat Free (skim); Unflavored; Grade A; pasteurized; homogenized; 1/2 pint carton	1: 0.2440 2: 0.2518 3: 0.2522 4: 0.2659	1: 0.2490 2: 0.2539 3: 0.2598 4: 0.2709	52130	Dairy Pure/50 case
25	LF White Pl	Milk; Low Fat (1%); Unflavored; Grade A; pasteurized; homogenized; 8 oz bottle	1: 0.3094 2: 0.3139 3: 0.3143 4: 0.3210	1: 0.3144 2: 0.3160 3: 0.3219 4: 0.3260	52131	Dairy Pure/50 case
26	FF Choc	Milk; Fat Free (skim); Chocolate; Grade A; pasteurized; homogenized; 1/2 pint carton	1: 0.2440 2: 0.2518 3: 0.2522 4: 0.2659	1: 0.2490 2: 0.2539 3: 0.2598 4: 0.2709	48116	Dairy Pure/50 case
27	FF Choc Pl	Milk; Fat Free (skim); Chocolate; Grade A; pasteurized; homogenized; 8 oz. plastic bottle	1: 0.3094 2: 0.3139 3: 0.3143 4: 0.3210	1: 0.3144 2: 0.3160 3: 0.3219 4: 0.3260	50675	Dairy Pure/50 case
28	FF St	Milk; Fat Free (skim); Strawberry; Grade A; pasteurized; homogenized; 1/2 pint carton	1: 0.2440 2: 0.2518 3: 0.2522 4: 0.2659	1: 0.2490 2: 0.2539 3: 0.2598 4: 0.2709	48143	Dairy Pure/50 case
29	FF St Pl	Milk; Fat Free (skim); Strawberry; Grade A; pasteurized; homogenized; 8 oz. plastic bottle	1: 0.3094 2: 0.3139 3: 0.3143 4: 0.3210	1: 0.3144 2: 0.3160 3: 0.3219 4: 0.3260	50686	Dairy Pure/50 case
30	LF Vanilla	Milk; Low Fat; Vanilla; Grade A; pasteurized; homogenized; 1/2 pint carton	NO BID	NO BID		
31	LF Choc	Milk; Low Fat; Chocolate; Grade A; pasteurized; homogenized; 1/2 pint carton	1: 0.2440 2: 0.2518 3: 0.2522 4: 0.2659	1: 0.2490 2: 0.2539 3: 0.2598 4: 0.2709	48127	Dairy Pure/50 case
32	LF St	Milk; Low Fat; Strawberry; Grade A; pasteurized; homogenized; 1/2 pint carton	NO BID			
33	Lactose Free	Milk; Lactose free; 1%; 8 oz. plastic bottle	0.58000	0.58000	57001	Saputo Farms/12 case
40	Juice Apple	100% Juice; Apple; fortified with Vitamin C; 4 oz carton	0.16550	0.16550	42289	Ardmore Farms/70 case

BM2021 Milk/Juice

Valid August 01, 2020 - July 31, 2021

Updated: 08/04/2020

Oak Farms Dean Foods Dairy

Item #	Title	Description	DOE PPU	VOE PPU	MFR #	Vendor Description
41	Juice Grape	100% Juice; Grape; fortified with Vitamin C; 4 oz carton	0.17750	0.17750	42301	Ardmore Farms/70 case
42	Juice Mixed Fruit	100% Juice; Mixed Fruit; fortified with Vitamin C; 4 oz carton	0.1675	0.1675	423034	Ardmore Farms/70 case
43	Juice Orange	100% Juice; Orange; fortified with Vitamin C; 4 oz carton	0.1635	0.1635		Oak Farms/75 case
44	Juice Apple Cherry	100% Juice; Apple Cherry; fortified with Vitamin C; 4 oz carton	0.1735	0.1735	42292	Ardmore Farms/70 case

BM2021 Milk/Juice

Valid August 01, 2020 - July 31, 2021

Updated: 08/04/2020

Oak Farms Dean Foods Dairy

Item #	Title	Description	DOE PPU	VOE PPU	MFR #	Vendor Description
--------	-------	-------------	---------	---------	-------	--------------------

Removed

- 34 Dairy Free
- 45 Juice OP

Compliance with Terms & Conditions: Yes
Current Award Status: BM1920
Purchase Orders Accepted: Yes
Payment Terms: 30

DOE: District Owned Equipment
VOE: Vendor Owned Equipment

CONTACT:
JOHN SMRCINA
John_Smrcina@deanfoods.com
3114 SOUTH HASKELL AVE
DALLAS, TX 75223
214-818-3447
800-428-6455 (toll-free)
214-818-3407 (fax)

Group 1

Cumberland Academy, Frankston ISD

Group 2

Big Sandy ISD, Edgewood ISD, Leverett's Chapel ISD, Mt. Enterprise ISD, Ore City ISD, Rusk ISD, Tatum ISD, Winnsboro ISD

Group 3

Alba Golden ISD, New Summerfield ISD, Slocum ISD, Zavalla ISD

Group 4

Alto ISD, Broaddus ISD, Cayuga ISD, Cross Roads ISD, Douglass ISD, Excelsior ISD, Gary ISD, Hemphill ISD, Joaquin ISD, LaPoynor ISD, Martins Mill ISD, Martinsville ISD, Mineola ISD, San Augustine ISD, Shelbyville ISD, Timpson ISD, Wells ISD, West Sabine ISD