
BM2021 Ice Cream 
Valid August 01, 2020 - July 31, 2021

Updated: 08/05/2020

Item # Title Priority Category Description  DOE Mfr 

50 Bar Chocolate Crunch 50 ICE CREAM
Chocolate Crunch Bar; Wooden Stick; 

2.75 fl oz
0.390 2233

51 Bar Chunky Strawberry 51 ICE CREAM
Chunky Strawberry Bar; Wooden Stick; 

2.75 fl oz
0.550 43

51B 51 ICE CREAM 0.550 42

53 Bar Fudge 53 ICE CREAM
Chocolate Fudge Ice Cream Bar; Low fat; 

3 oz
0.380 4087

54 Bar Orange Dream 54 ICE CREAM
Orange Dream Bar; Wooden Stick; Low 

fat; 2.5 fl oz
0.380 4520

55 Bar Strawberry Crunch 55 ICE CREAM
Strawberry Crunch Bar; Wooden Stick; 

2.75 fl oz
0.390 2234

56 Cone Cookies & Cream 56 ICE CREAM
Cookies & Cream Ice Cream in chocolate 

wafer cone; Low fat; 3 oz
0.590 2401

57 Cone Vanilla 57 ICE CREAM
Vanilla Ice Cream in vanilla wafer cone; 

Low fat; 3 oz
0.590 2373

59 Cup Chocolate 59 ICE CREAM Chocolate Ice Cream; Low fat; 3 oz 0.390 2240

61 Cup Raspberry SF 61 ICE CREAM
Raspberry Sherbet Cup Styrofoam; Sugar 

Free; 4.0 fl oz
NO BID

62 Cup Vanilla SF 62 ICE CREAM
Vanilla Cup  Styrofoam; Sugar Free; 4.0 fl 

oz
NO BID

63 Pop Banana Fudge Jr. 63 ICE CREAM Banana Fudge Pop; Wooden Stick; 1.5 oz 0.220 2787

64 Popsicle Pineapple 64 ICE CREAM Pineapple Popsicle; Pouch; 2.5 fl oz 0.550 2235

64B Popsicle Pineapple 64 ICE CREAM 0.550 2235

67 Sandwich Chocolate 67 ICE CREAM
Chocolate sandwich with vanilla ice 

cream; Low fat; 3 oz
0.380 2232

69 Bar Apple/Watermelon 69 ICE CREAM
Pucker Powder Bars Assorted 

Apple/Watermelon; 2.75 oz
NO BID

70 New

Yumi Ice CreamUpdated 10/02/2020



BM2021 Ice Cream 
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Yumi Ice CreamUpdated 10/02/2020
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BM2021 Ice Cream 
Valid August 01, 2020 - July 31, 2021

Updated: 08/05/2020

Item # Title Priority Category Description  DOE Mfr 

Yumi Ice CreamUpdated 10/02/2020

52 Bar Cookies & Cream Compliance with Terms & Conditions: Yes

58 Cone Vanilla Mini Current Award Status: BM1920

60 Cup Cookies & Cream Purchase Orders Accepted: Yes

65 Push-Up Lemon-Lime Payment Terms: 30

66 Push-Up Orange None

68 Sandwich Vanilla

DOE: District Owned Equipment

VOE: Vendor Owned Equipment

Participating Members:

ALL DISTRICTS

REMOVED:



BM2021 Ice Cream 
Valid August 01, 2020 - July 31, 2021

Updated: 08/05/2020

Item # Title Priority Category Description

50 Bar Chocolate Crunch 50 ICE CREAM
Chocolate Crunch Bar; Wooden Stick; 

2.75 fl oz

51 Bar Chunky Strawberry 51 ICE CREAM
Chunky Strawberry Bar; Wooden Stick; 

2.75 fl oz

51B 51 ICE CREAM

53 Bar Fudge 53 ICE CREAM
Chocolate Fudge Ice Cream Bar; Low fat; 

3 oz

54 Bar Orange Dream 54 ICE CREAM
Orange Dream Bar; Wooden Stick; Low 

fat; 2.5 fl oz

55 Bar Strawberry Crunch 55 ICE CREAM
Strawberry Crunch Bar; Wooden Stick; 

2.75 fl oz

56 Cone Cookies & Cream 56 ICE CREAM
Cookies & Cream Ice Cream in chocolate 

wafer cone; Low fat; 3 oz

57 Cone Vanilla 57 ICE CREAM
Vanilla Ice Cream in vanilla wafer cone; 

Low fat; 3 oz

59 Cup Chocolate 59 ICE CREAM Chocolate Ice Cream; Low fat; 3 oz

61 Cup Raspberry SF 61 ICE CREAM
Raspberry Sherbet Cup Styrofoam; Sugar 

Free; 4.0 fl oz

62 Cup Vanilla SF 62 ICE CREAM
Vanilla Cup  Styrofoam; Sugar Free; 4.0 fl 

oz

63 Pop Banana Fudge Jr. 63 ICE CREAM Banana Fudge Pop; Wooden Stick; 1.5 oz

64 Popsicle Pineapple 64 ICE CREAM Pineapple Popsicle; Pouch; 2.5 fl oz

64B Popsicle Pineapple 64 ICE CREAM

67 Sandwich Chocolate 67 ICE CREAM
Chocolate sandwich with vanilla ice 

cream; Low fat; 3 oz

69 Bar Apple/Watermelon 69 ICE CREAM
Pucker Powder Bars Assorted 

Apple/Watermelon; 2.75 oz

70 New

Updated 10/02/2020

Vendor Description
Wells Blue Bunny, 144 units, 3.0oz, 7064001447

Wells Blue Bunny, 24 units, 3.0oz, 7094001384

Wells Blue Bunny, 24 units, 3.5oz, 70640020638 

Wells Blue Bunny, 24 units, 3.0oz, 7064030011

Wells Blue Bunny, 24 units, 3.0oz, 7064030062

Wells Blue Bunny, 144 units, 3.0oz, 7064001446

Wells Blue Bunny, 48 units, 2.5oz, 7064001549

Wells Blue Bunny, 48 units, 2.5oz, 7064001549

Vanilla/Chocolate Ice Cream Cups; 3 Oz; 48 per 

case

Wells Blue Bunny, 24 units, 1.75oz., 

7064001537

Wells Blue Bunny, 24 units, 4oz, 7064001383

Wells Blue Bunny, 24 units, 3.5oz, 70640020645

Wells Blue Bunny, 96 units, 3.0oz, 7064001445

Yumi Ice Cream



BM2021 Ice Cream 
Valid August 01, 2020 - July 31, 2021

Updated: 08/05/2020

Item # Title Priority Category Description

Updated 10/02/2020

71 New

72 New

73 New

74 New

75 New

76 New

77 New

78 New

79 New

80 New

81 New

82 New

83 New

84 New

85 New

86 New

87 New

88 New

89 New

90 New

91 New

92 New

93 New

94 New

Vendor Description

Yumi Ice Cream



BM2021 Ice Cream 
Valid August 01, 2020 - July 31, 2021

Updated: 08/05/2020

Item # Title Priority Category Description

Updated 10/02/2020

95 New

96 New

97 New

98 New

99 New

100 New

101 New

102 New

103 New

104 New

105 New

106 New

107 New

108 New

109 New

110 New

111 New

112 New

113 New

114 New

115 New

116 New

117 New

118 New

Vendor Description

Yumi Ice Cream



BM2021 Ice Cream 
Valid August 01, 2020 - July 31, 2021

Updated: 08/05/2020

Item # Title Priority Category Description

Updated 10/02/2020

119 New

120 New

121 New

122 New

123 New

124 New

125 New

126 New

127 New

128 New

129 New

130 New

131 New

Vendor Description

Yumi Ice Cream



BM2021 Ice Cream 
Valid August 01, 2020 - July 31, 2021

Updated: 08/05/2020

Item # Title Priority Category Description

Updated 10/02/2020

52 Bar Cookies & Cream Compliance with Terms & Conditions:

58 Cone Vanilla Mini Current Award Status:

60 Cup Cookies & Cream Purchase Orders Accepted:

65 Push-Up Lemon-Lime Payment Terms:

66 Push-Up Orange

68 Sandwich Vanilla

DOE: District Owned Equipment

VOE: Vendor Owned Equipment

REMOVED:

Vendor Description

Yumi Ice Cream

CONTACT:

ERIKA O'GRADY

erika@yumiicecream.com

3551 PLANO PKWY #210

THE COLONY, TX 75056

214-630-2300

214-218-6801 (toll-free)

214-630-6932 (fax)

Participating Members:

ALL DISTRICTS



BM2021 Ice Cream 
Valid August 01, 2020 - July 31, 2021

Updated: 08/05/2020

Item # Title Priority Category Description

50 Bar Chocolate Crunch 50 ICE CREAM
Chocolate Crunch Bar; Wooden Stick; 

2.75 fl oz

51 Bar Chunky Strawberry 51 ICE CREAM
Chunky Strawberry Bar; Wooden Stick; 

2.75 fl oz

51B 51 ICE CREAM

53 Bar Fudge 53 ICE CREAM
Chocolate Fudge Ice Cream Bar; Low fat; 

3 oz

54 Bar Orange Dream 54 ICE CREAM
Orange Dream Bar; Wooden Stick; Low 

fat; 2.5 fl oz

55 Bar Strawberry Crunch 55 ICE CREAM
Strawberry Crunch Bar; Wooden Stick; 

2.75 fl oz

56 Cone Cookies & Cream 56 ICE CREAM
Cookies & Cream Ice Cream in chocolate 

wafer cone; Low fat; 3 oz

57 Cone Vanilla 57 ICE CREAM
Vanilla Ice Cream in vanilla wafer cone; 

Low fat; 3 oz

59 Cup Chocolate 59 ICE CREAM Chocolate Ice Cream; Low fat; 3 oz

61 Cup Raspberry SF 61 ICE CREAM
Raspberry Sherbet Cup Styrofoam; Sugar 

Free; 4.0 fl oz

62 Cup Vanilla SF 62 ICE CREAM
Vanilla Cup  Styrofoam; Sugar Free; 4.0 fl 

oz

63 Pop Banana Fudge Jr. 63 ICE CREAM Banana Fudge Pop; Wooden Stick; 1.5 oz

64 Popsicle Pineapple 64 ICE CREAM Pineapple Popsicle; Pouch; 2.5 fl oz

64B Popsicle Pineapple 64 ICE CREAM

67 Sandwich Chocolate 67 ICE CREAM
Chocolate sandwich with vanilla ice 

cream; Low fat; 3 oz

69 Bar Apple/Watermelon 69 ICE CREAM
Pucker Powder Bars Assorted 

Apple/Watermelon; 2.75 oz

70 New

Updated 10/02/2020

VOE  Mfr # 

0.404 24682-31150

1.335 24682-31208

0.372 24682-31152

0.372 24682-31174

NO BID No Bid

NO BID No Bid

0.548 24682-31303

0.345 24682-31665

0.365 24682-31500

0.354 24682-31664

1.066 24682-31230

NO BID No Bid

0.504 24682-31319

0.372 24682-31000

30.960

Klement Distributing



BM2021 Ice Cream 
Valid August 01, 2020 - July 31, 2021

Updated: 08/05/2020

Item # Title Priority Category Description

Updated 10/02/2020

71 New

72 New

73 New

74 New

75 New

76 New

77 New

78 New

79 New

80 New

81 New

82 New

83 New

84 New

85 New

86 New

87 New

88 New

89 New

90 New

91 New

92 New

93 New

94 New

VOE  Mfr # 

Klement Distributing

30.960

30.960

35.950

35.950

1.335 24682-31207

0.292 24682-31154

0.350 24682-31109

0.350 24682-31105

0.350 24682-31104

0.350 24682-31108

1.463 24682-31341

1.463 24682-31329

1.463 24682-31340

1.850 24682-31280

1.850 24682-31285

1.763 24682-31268

1.763 24682-31267

1.763 24682-31333

1.763 24682-31336

0.365 24682-31400

0.365 24682-31420

0.365 24682-31430

0.365 24682-31480

0.365 24682-31490



BM2021 Ice Cream 
Valid August 01, 2020 - July 31, 2021

Updated: 08/05/2020

Item # Title Priority Category Description

Updated 10/02/2020

95 New

96 New

97 New

98 New

99 New

100 New

101 New

102 New

103 New

104 New

105 New

106 New

107 New

108 New

109 New

110 New

111 New

112 New

113 New

114 New

115 New

116 New

117 New

118 New

VOE  Mfr # 

Klement Distributing

0.365 24682-31510

0.365 24682-31520

0.365 24682-31530

0.374 24682-31475

0.374 24682-31450

0.374 24682-31470

0.301 24682-31550

0.301 24682-31551

0.301 24682-31552

0.301 24682-31553

1.845 24682-31305

1.845 24682-31312

1.845 24682-31313

0.994 24682-31302

0.548 24682-31306

0.550 24682-31358

0.548 24682-31307

0.372 24682-31001

0.372 24682-31155

0.404 24682-31151

0.404 24682-31167

1.067 24682-31234

1.067 24682-31232

0.354 24682-31352



BM2021 Ice Cream 
Valid August 01, 2020 - July 31, 2021

Updated: 08/05/2020

Item # Title Priority Category Description

Updated 10/02/2020

119 New

120 New

121 New

122 New

123 New

124 New

125 New

126 New

127 New

128 New

129 New

130 New

131 New

VOE  Mfr # 

Klement Distributing

0.504 24682-31359

0.504 24682-31355

0.504 24682-31356

0.548 24682-50260

0.548 24682-50245

0.548 24682-50246

0.354 24682-31663

0.354 24682-31662

0.354 24682-31669

0.295 24682-31666

0.295 24682-31667

0.295 24682-31642

0.295 24682-31644



BM2021 Ice Cream 
Valid August 01, 2020 - July 31, 2021

Updated: 08/05/2020

Item # Title Priority Category Description

Updated 10/02/2020

52 Bar Cookies & Cream Compliance with Terms & Conditions:

58 Cone Vanilla Mini Current Award Status:

60 Cup Cookies & Cream Purchase Orders Accepted:

65 Push-Up Lemon-Lime Payment Terms:

66 Push-Up Orange

68 Sandwich Vanilla

DOE: District Owned Equipment

VOE: Vendor Owned Equipment

REMOVED:

VOE  Mfr # 

Klement Distributing

No. Minimums Required

None

Yes

30

Yes

Participating Members:

Edgewood ISD, Lindale ISD, Longview ISD, Mineola ISD, *, Van ISD



BM2021 Ice Cream 
Valid August 01, 2020 - July 31, 2021

Updated: 08/05/2020

Item # Title Priority Category Description

50 Bar Chocolate Crunch 50 ICE CREAM
Chocolate Crunch Bar; Wooden Stick; 

2.75 fl oz

51 Bar Chunky Strawberry 51 ICE CREAM
Chunky Strawberry Bar; Wooden Stick; 

2.75 fl oz

51B 51 ICE CREAM

53 Bar Fudge 53 ICE CREAM
Chocolate Fudge Ice Cream Bar; Low fat; 

3 oz

54 Bar Orange Dream 54 ICE CREAM
Orange Dream Bar; Wooden Stick; Low 

fat; 2.5 fl oz

55 Bar Strawberry Crunch 55 ICE CREAM
Strawberry Crunch Bar; Wooden Stick; 

2.75 fl oz

56 Cone Cookies & Cream 56 ICE CREAM
Cookies & Cream Ice Cream in chocolate 

wafer cone; Low fat; 3 oz

57 Cone Vanilla 57 ICE CREAM
Vanilla Ice Cream in vanilla wafer cone; 

Low fat; 3 oz

59 Cup Chocolate 59 ICE CREAM Chocolate Ice Cream; Low fat; 3 oz

61 Cup Raspberry SF 61 ICE CREAM
Raspberry Sherbet Cup Styrofoam; Sugar 

Free; 4.0 fl oz

62 Cup Vanilla SF 62 ICE CREAM
Vanilla Cup  Styrofoam; Sugar Free; 4.0 fl 

oz

63 Pop Banana Fudge Jr. 63 ICE CREAM Banana Fudge Pop; Wooden Stick; 1.5 oz

64 Popsicle Pineapple 64 ICE CREAM Pineapple Popsicle; Pouch; 2.5 fl oz

64B Popsicle Pineapple 64 ICE CREAM

67 Sandwich Chocolate 67 ICE CREAM
Chocolate sandwich with vanilla ice 

cream; Low fat; 3 oz

69 Bar Apple/Watermelon 69 ICE CREAM
Pucker Powder Bars Assorted 

Apple/Watermelon; 2.75 oz

70 New

Updated 10/02/2020

 Vendor Description 
Chocolate Scooter Bar; Wooden Stick; 2.75 oz; 

36 per case 

Strawberry Scooter Bar; Wooden Stick; 2.75 

oz; 24 per case

Fudge-O Bar; Fat Free; 2 oz; 36 per case

Low Fat Orange Blossom Bar; 2.5 oz; 36 per 

case

Low Fat Crazy Cone; 4 oz; 24 per case

Chocolate Ice Cream Dessert Cup; Low Fat; 3 

oz; 48 per case

Raspberry Sherbet Cup; 4 oz; 24 per case

Vanilla Ice Cream Cup; Low Fat; 3oz; 48 per 

case

Banana Cream Tropi-Kool Fruit Bar; Low Fat; 

Wooden Stick; 4 oz; 24 per case

Vanilla Ice Cream Sandwich; Low Fat; 4 oz; 24 

per case

Fruit Punch Freeze Polar Blast Fruit Juice Bar; 

Fat Free; 2.25 oz; 36 per case

Premium Bulk Flavors; 3 Gallon Cans

Klement Distributing



BM2021 Ice Cream 
Valid August 01, 2020 - July 31, 2021

Updated: 08/05/2020

Item # Title Priority Category Description

Updated 10/02/2020

71 New

72 New

73 New

74 New

75 New

76 New

77 New

78 New

79 New

80 New

81 New

82 New

83 New

84 New

85 New

86 New

87 New

88 New

89 New

90 New

91 New

92 New

93 New

94 New

 Vendor Description 

Klement Distributing

Yogurt Bulk 3 Gallon Cans

Sherbet / Sorbet Bulk 3 Gallon Cans

Premium Gold Bulk Flavors; 3 Gallon Cans

Reduced Fat / No Sugar Added Bulk 3 Gallon 

Cans

Chocolate Éclair; 4 oz; Wooden stick; 24 per 

case

Sugar Free Orange Ice Pop; 2.5 oz; Wooden 

stick; 36 per case

Single Stick Banana; 2.5 oz; Wooden stick; 36 

per case

Single Stick Cherry; 2.5 oz; Wooden stick; 36 

per case

Single Stick Orange; 2.5 oz; Wooden stick; 36 

per case

Single Stick Watermelon; 2.52 oz; Wooden 

stick; 36 per case

Giant Vanilla Sandwich; 6 oz; 24 per case

Andes Mint Sandwich; 6 oz; 24 per case

Giant Neo Sandwich; 6 oz; 24 per case

Polar Bear Round Sandwich; Chocolate Chip; 

4.5 oz; 24 per case

Polar Bear Round Sandwich; Cookies and 

Cream; 4.5 oz; 24 per case

Cotton Candy Cup; 6 oz; 12 per case

Cookies and Cream Cup; 6 oz; 12 per case

Chocolate Sundae Cup; 6 oz; 12 per case

Dulce De Leche Cup; 6 oz; 12 per case

Chocolate Ice Cream 4 oz; 24 per case

Strawberry Ice Cream 4 oz; 24 per case

Vanilla Ice Cream 4 oz; 24 per case

Lemon Sherbet 4 oz; 24 per case

Orange Sherbet 4 oz; 24 per case



BM2021 Ice Cream 
Valid August 01, 2020 - July 31, 2021

Updated: 08/05/2020

Item # Title Priority Category Description

Updated 10/02/2020

95 New

96 New

97 New

98 New

99 New

100 New

101 New

102 New

103 New

104 New

105 New

106 New

107 New

108 New

109 New

110 New

111 New

112 New

113 New

114 New

115 New

116 New

117 New

118 New

 Vendor Description 

Klement Distributing

Lemon Ice 4 oz; 24 per case

Orange Ice 4 oz; 24 per case

Raspberry Ice 4 oz; 24 per case

No Sugar Lemon Ice 4 oz; 24 per case

RF/NSA Chocolate 4 oz; 24 per case

RF/NSA Vanilla 4 oz; 24 per case

Tally Ho Low Fat Vanilla 4 oz; 24 per case

Tally Ho Low Fat Chocolate 4 oz; 24 per case

Tally Ho Lemon Ice 4 oz; 24 per case

Tally Ho Orange Sherbet 4 oz; 24 per case

Moose Tracks Cone; 6 oz; 12 per case

Incredible Cone; 6 oz; 12 per case

Cappuccino Crunch Cone; Limited Edition; 6 

oz; 12 per case

P. Nutty Cone; 4 oz; 24 per case

LF Cookies 'N Cream Cone; 4 oz; 24 per case

LF Caramel Mochaccino Conez; 24 per case

Vanilla / Chocolate Twist Cone; 4 oz; 24 per 

case

Sour Apple Polar Blast Bar; 36 per case

NP Cotton Candy Bar; 2.5 oz; 36 per case

Strawberry Scooter; 2.75 oz; 36 per case

Salted Caramel Brownie Crunch; Wooden 

stick; 2.75 oz; 36 per case

Strawberry Tropi-Kool Fruit Bar; Wooden stick; 

4 oz; 24 per case

Mango Tropi-Kool Fruit Bar; Wooden stick; 4 

oz; 24 per case

NP Mini Vanilla Ice Cream Sandwich- 2.5 oz 48 

per case



BM2021 Ice Cream 
Valid August 01, 2020 - July 31, 2021

Updated: 08/05/2020

Item # Title Priority Category Description

Updated 10/02/2020

119 New

120 New

121 New

122 New

123 New

124 New

125 New

126 New

127 New

128 New

129 New

130 New

131 New

 Vendor Description 

Klement Distributing

LF Llama Party Ice Cream Sandwich; 24 per 

case

Reduced Fat Cookies and Cream Sandwich; 4 

oz; 24 per case

Reduced Fat Brownie Batter Sandwich; 4 oz; 

24 per case

Blue Raspberry Twister Cups; 3.75 oz; 18 per 

case

NF Cotton Candy Yogurt Twister Cups; 3.75 oz; 

18 per case

NF Unicorn Horn Twister Cup; 3.75 oz; 18 per 

case

Strawberry Sundae Dessert Cup; 3 oz; 48 per 

case

Chocolate Sundae Dessert Cup; 3 oz; 48 per 

case

All-Star Sundae; 3 oz; 48 per case

Spooky Sundae Dessert Cup; 3 oz; 48 per case 

SEASONAL

Candy Cane Dessert Cup; 3 oz; 48 per case 

SEASONAL

Cherry Vanilla Swirl Dessert Cup; 3 oz; 48 per 

case SEASONAL

Spring Party Dessert Cup; 3 oz; 48 per case 

SEASONAL



BM2021 Ice Cream 
Valid August 01, 2020 - July 31, 2021

Updated: 08/05/2020

Item # Title Priority Category Description

Updated 10/02/2020

52 Bar Cookies & Cream Compliance with Terms & Conditions:

58 Cone Vanilla Mini Current Award Status:

60 Cup Cookies & Cream Purchase Orders Accepted:

65 Push-Up Lemon-Lime Payment Terms:

66 Push-Up Orange

68 Sandwich Vanilla

DOE: District Owned Equipment

VOE: Vendor Owned Equipment

REMOVED:

 Vendor Description 

Klement Distributing

CONTACT: 

COURTNY STROM

courtny.strom@klementford.com

3271 S HWY 287

DECATUR, TX 76234

940-627-1773

940-627-0227 (fax)

Edgewood ISD, Lindale ISD, Longview ISD, Mineola ISD, *, Van ISD

mailto:courtny.strom@klementford.com

