8/2/2010 REGION 7 PURCHASING COOPERATIVE
Copy Paper Bid 2010-2011 Participating Members

****NOTE: Only the schools listed below are able to utilize this award. If your school district would like to be included in this
award, please contact Martha Lakey at (903) 988-6859.****

1. Alba-Golden ISD 31. Hemphill ISD 61. Sabine ISD
2. Arp ISD 32. Henderson ISD 62. San Augustine ISD
3. Athens ISD 33. Huntington ISD 63. Scurry-Rosser ISD
4. Beckville ISD 34, lowa Park ISD 64. Shelbyville ISD
5. Big Sandy ISD 35, Jacksonville ISD 65. Spring Hill ISD
6. Brownsboro ISD 36. Jefferson ISD 66. Tatum ISD
7. Bullard ISD 37.Joaquin ISD 67. Tenaha ISD
8. Canton ISD 38. Kemp ISD 68. Terrell ISD
9. Center ISD 39. Kilgore College 69. Trinidad ISD
10. Central Heights ISD 40. Kilgore ISD 70. Tyler ISD
11. Central ISD 41. Leverett's Chapel ISD 71. Union Grove ISD
12. Chapel Hill ISD - ESC 7 42. Lindale ISD 72.Van ISD
13. Crandall ISD 43. Linden-Kildare ISD 73. Waskom ISD
14. Cross Roads ISD 44. Longview ISD 74. Westwood ISD
15. Cushing ISD 45, Lufkin ISD 75. White Oak ISD
16. Diboll ISD 46. Mabank ISD 76. Whitehouse ISD
17. Edgewood ISD 47. Malakoff ISD 77. Winnsboro ISD
18. Elkhart ISD 48. Marshall ISD 78. Winona ISD
19. Elysian Fields ISD 49. Martinsville ISD 79. Yantis ISD
20. Eustace ISD 50. Mineola ISD
21. Excelsior ISD 51. Mt. Enterprise ISD
22. Fairfield ISD 52. Murchison ISD
23. Frankston ISD 53. Nacogdoches ISD
24. Fruitvale ISD 54. New Diana ISD
25. Gilmer ISD 55. Ore City ISD
26. Gladewater ISD 56. Palestine ISD
27. Grand Saline ISD 57. Pine Tree ISD
28. Hallsville ISD 58. Pittsburg ISD
29. Harleton ISD 59. Rains ISD

30. Head Start, Region 7 60. Rusk ISD



#CP1011 REGION VII PURCHASING COOPERATIVE
| COPY PAPER BID 2010 - 2011

AWARDED VENDORS - BY LINE ITEM

}| AWARD LISTING VALID: APR 21, 2010 - APR 26, 2011 l

NOTE: Awarded Vendor Addresses & Terms begin on page 5.

Bid Price (per case)

1. Bond /Duplicating Paper, 20# weight, Flatt Stationers

8 1/2” x 117, Multi Purpose 27.00
2. Bond /Duplicating Paper, 20# weight, Flatt Stationers

8 1/2” x 14”, Multi Purpose 38.55

Paper. color. White ’
3. Bond /Duplicating Paper, 20# weight, Flatt Stationers

117 x 177, Multi Purpose 29 36

Paper. color. White '
4. Bond /Duplicating Paper, 20# weight, Flatt Stationers

8 1/2” x 117, Multi Purpose 29 36

Paper. color. White. 3-hole '
5. Bond Paper, 20# weight, Flatt Stationers

81/2” x 11", color, Red 59.40

60#, Ruby Red

6. Bond Paper, 20# weight, Flatt Stationers

81/2” x 117, color, Pink 37.45
7. Bond Paper, 20# weight, Flatt Stationers

8 1/2” x 117, color, Green 37.45
8. Bond Paper, 20# weight, Flatt Stationers

81/2” x 117, color, Canary 37.45
9. Bond Paper, 20# weight, Flatt Stationers

81/2” x 117, color, Ivory 37.45
10. Bond Paper, 20# weight, Flatt Stationers

81/2” x 117, color, Buff 37.45
11. Bond Paper, 20# weight, 8 1/2” No Bid

x 11", color, Ladyslipper (mauve) No Bid
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Mookl AVWARDED VENDORS - BY LINE ITEM - contd. (terms,page 5) [Bid Price (per case)|

12. Bond Paper, 20# weight, Flatt Stationers
81/2” x 117, color, Salmon 37.45
13. Bond Paper, 20# weight, Flatt Stationers
8 1/2” x 117, color, Orange 37.45
Pumpkin
14. Bond Paper, 20# weight, Flatt Stationers
81/2” x 117, color, Goldenrod 37.45
15. Bond Paper, 20# weight, Flatt Stationers
81/2” x 117, color, Mist Gray 37.45
16. Bond Paper, 20# weight, Flatt Stationers
81/2” x 11", color, Tan 37.45
17. Bond Paper, 20# weight, Flatt Stationers
81/2” x 117, color, Orchid 37.45
18. Bond Paper, 20# weight, Flatt Stationers
81/2” x 117, color, Blue 37.45
19. Bond Paper, 60# weight, Unisource
8 1/2” x 117, color, Canary 37.50
20#, pastel
20. Bond Paper, 20# weight, Flatt Stationers
81/2” x 117, color, Purple 59.40
60# wt
21. Text Paper, 80# weight, No Award
81/2" X 11", glossy, color, White No Award
22. Parchment, 60# weight, No Award
81/2” x 117, color, Natural No Award
23. Parchment, 60# weight, No Award
81/2" x 11", color, Green No Award

20f5



ezl ikl AVWARDED VENDORS - BY LINE ITEM - contd. (terms,page 5)

[Bid Price (per case)|

24. Parchment, 60# weight, No Award
81/2” x 117, color, White No Award
25. Parchment, 60# weight, No Award
81/2” x 11”, color, Sand No Award
53.60
26. Vellum - 60# weight, Flatt Stationers 67.60

81/2” x 117, color, Turquoise

Astrobrite, Teal, 60# wt

27. Vellum - 60# weight, Unisource

81/2” x 11”, color, Fireball Fuschia 63.59
28. Vellum - 60# weight, Unisource

81/2” x 117, color, Solar Yellow 63.59
29. Cover - 65# weight, Flatt Stationers 34.00

81/2” x 11", color, White

67#, Vellum Bristol

30. Cover - 65# weight, Flatt Stationers
81/2” x 117, color, Solar Yellow 53.60

31. Cover - 65# weight, Flatt Stationers
81/2” x 117, color, Re-Entry Red 53.60

32. Cover - 65# weight, Flatt Stationers
53.60

81/2” x 117, color, Orange

Cosmic Orange

33.

Cover - 65# weight,

Flatt Stationers

81/2” x 117, color, Galaxy Gold 53.60
34. Cover - 65# weight, Flatt Stationers

81/2” x 11", color, Violet 53.60
35. Cover - 65# weight, Flatt Stationers

81/2” x 11", color, Celestial Blue 53.60
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Mookl AVWARDED VENDORS - BY LINE ITEM - contd. (terms,page 5) [Bid Price (per case)|

36. Cover - 65# weight, Unisource

81/2” x 117, color, Pink 51.33
37. Cover - 65# weight, Unisource

81/2” x 11", color, Green 51.33
38. Cover - 65# weight, No Bid

81/2” x 117, color, French Linen No Bid
39. Cover - 65# * weight, No Award

81/2” x 117, color, Parchment No Award
40. Cover, 65# weight*, Flatt Stationers

81/2” x 117, color, Gray 36.00

67#, Vellum Bristol

41. NCR-Carbonless paper, Flatt Stationers

2-part, 8 1/2" x 11” 64.50

(Superior Brand or Eaual)

42. NCR-Carbonless paper, Flatt Stationers
3-part, 8 1/2" x 11” 70.55

(Superior Brand or Eaual)

43. NCR-Carbonless paper, Unisource 107.18

?—part,- 117x 1‘(:" ) 8 1/2 x 14, Appleton NCR
Superior Brand or Eaua Superior Brand

44. NCR-Carbonless paper, Flatt Stationers
4-part, 8 1/2” x 117 75.50

(Superior Brand or Eaual)

45. NCR-Carbonless paper, Flatt Stationers
5-part, 8 1/2” x 11” 77.50

(Superior Brand or Eaual)

46. NCR-Carbonless paper, Flatt Stationers
6-part, 8 1/2" x 11" 79.60

(Superior Brand or Eaual)

47. Vellum Bristol, 67# weight, Flatt Stationers
81/2”x11” , Blue 36.00
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48. Vellum Bristol, 67# weight, Flatt Stationers

81/2” x 11", White 34.00
49. Railroad Board - Flatt Stationers

6-ply, (.024), 22" x 28", color, Asst. Colors 36.00

VENDOR TERMS & CONDITIONS:
Flatt Stationers NET 30
Janet Smith
P O Box 1013
Mexia, Tx 76667
Tollfree: 800-792-3281
Fax: 254-562-7331

Unisource Net 30

Mike Freeman

2828 Trade Center Dr., Ste. 140 Billing: 850 N. Arlington Heights Road
Carrollton, Tx 75007 Itasca, IL 60143

800-897-1174 x2482 800-598-9365 or 800-874-9165
Fax: 800-488-8504 Fax: 866-487-6325
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